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Julieth Alexandra Link
Digital Media Portfolio
M.S in Communications and Media



Artist Statement

Throughout my undergraduate and graduate education, my inspiration has been digitally
communicating the written word through my photography and digital design. I was
adopted when I was twelve with very little understanding of the English language. I
learned to communicate with my father through visuals, images, and colors until the time
that I was able to communicate through words.

When someone is placed in a different culture with a language that is unknown, the only
way to communicate ideas and thoughts is through images and photographs. Because of
my situation not knowing any English besides the word mother, father, and chocolate (yes,
chocolate), I had to learn how to communicate with my father through the use of anything
but words. My passion now is really harnessing the same type of thinking because I believe
visuals, images, and photography are such a higher quality and provide a better ability to
communicate.



Artist Statement

My focus on all my digital design classes has been to communicate feelings and thought
patterns through color patterns and design where someone can see an image or design to
understand whether I am communicating a scene with a photo or selling an idea with
design and information on a page. So many of my ideas and design revolve around the
ocean and water because they have a calming effect on most people.

Therefore with my design, I can convey information while providing peace and tranquility
to the person seeing my photography and design. My start with communication through
visuals began with my photography and my love and connection with the ocean and beach.
My work evolved to include delivering colorful designs with all the elements and programs
from all my graduate classes.



Artist Statement

My passion became to blend art, design, and photography into elements that would attract
the attention of the viewer but at the same time provide the color and flare where the
viewer does not need many words to understand the idea that is being communicated.
Using all my skills and designs, one of my passions has become the creation of logos that
communicate to the viewer what a company represents along with being visually
appealing, so the viewer remembers the logo.

My work, through the use of colorful and graphically incorporated design, has a long and
sustained effect on a viewer where the viewer feels a connection with the image. With either
a photograph or a design, the viewer makes an instant connection and has a better
understanding and perception of the information needing to be communicated. To me and
in my photographs and design, I know its cliché, but I feel an image or design is worth a
thousand or more words.
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Start a Text Conversation with Customers

Frictionless User Experience.

Click, Send, Connect!

Click-2-TextTM Conversational Marketing

Embed a C2T Tag by 

Connection on any 

digital asset.

Customer clicks on an 

digital ad or video with 

C2T Tag.
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an instant text 
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•  Remove consumer friction across all of 

your digital campaigns with the Click to 

Conversation concept. Start providing instant  

results with messaging without relying on third 

party widgets that  provide limited, inaccurate, 

or no reporting as to performance.

•  Build, monetize & engage your own 

“Messaging Channel” to a  private, dynamically 

generated, always on, private audience 

network. Deliver relevant messages and 

create meaningful experiences  at a fraction of 

the cost and in a fraction of the time.

•  Opt-in = Existing Customer. This is how 

brands need to value a  database of real people 

willing to receive “media” via messaging 

because it is 99% guaranteed to “impress” or 

be  read.

•  Incorporate across all campaigns, control the 

message and provide meaningful outcomes 

for your clients without the cost of expensive 

and  unreliable ad platforms.

•  Carrier direct relationship means business 

landline text-enablement is available at 

a fraction of the cost relative to 3rd party 

aggregators.

•  Messaging is Media. Own the “Always on 

Channel” and take  control of your results.

NEW

50%

60-70%

31%

5-20%

Try New Products Spend More Money

Existing customers are 50% more likely to 

try new prodcuts and spend 31% more, 

when compared to new customers.

The probability of selling to an existing 

customer is 60-70%, while the probability of 

selling to a new prospect is 5-20%.

Existing Customer New Customer











Text! The Future of Customer Centric Solutions

1. Why Connections 

Solution?

2. Chat 3. Messaging

Allows the Consumer 

to proceed at their own time.

Universally Available.

No App Needed to Install.

Can be transmitting over 

the same business line with 

Connections.

Build Trust with the Customer!

Allows for re-engagement 

with promotional messages 

over Conversational Lines with 

Connections. 

Allows universal customer 

engagement driver with 

Connections. 

Allows multiple numbers and 

Multi-view capabilities for 

tracking and attribution. 

•  Doesn’t allow customer to 

proceed at their own time.

•  Still missing all engagement 

with all messages going to the 

current business line. 

•  Doesn’t allow any re-

engagement.

•  Once you end a chat session, 

no way to restart where 

customer left off. 

•  No Universal Customer 

Engagement Driver (Can’t 

be placed on dynamic ads or 

across the digital sphere).

•  No Trust- Just Frustration!

•  Doesn’t allow customer to 

proceed at their own time.

•  Still missing all engagement 

with all messages going to the 

current business line. 

•  Doesn’t allow any re-

engagement.

•  Must download app .

•  Once you end chat session, no 

way to restart where customer 

left off. 

•  Forced into the 

communication in the 

communication channel with 

the app- Is that Trust!

•  No Universal Customer 

Engagement Driver.
LiveChat



Thank you


	Words Through the Lens of Design
	Recommended Citation

	PowerPoint Presentation

