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Program 
 
 
Concerto No. 3 in B Minor    Camille Saint-Saens 

Allegro non troppo (1835-1921) 
 

Mozhu Yan, violin 
Sheng-Yuan Kuan, piano 

 
 

Concerto No. 3 in B Minor    Camille Saint-Saens 
Andantino quasi allegretto (1835-1921) 

 
Julia Jakkel, violin 

Sheng-Yuan Kuan, piano 
 
 
 

INTERMISSION 
 
 
Scottish Fantasy, Op. 46                Max Bruch 

Adagio cantabile (1838-1920) 
 

Anna Tsukervanik, violin 
Sheng-Yuan Kuan, piano 

 
 
Violin Concerto No. 1  Niccolo Paganini 

Allegro maestoso – Tempo giusto (1782-1840) 
 

Yordan Tenev, violin 
Sheng-Yuan Kuan, piano 



 

 

ILYA KALER 

Described by London’s Gramophone as a ‘magician, bewitching our ears’, Ilya Kaler is one of the most 
outstanding personalities of the violin today. Among his many awards include 1st Prizes and Gold Medals at 
the Tchaikovsky (1986), the Sibelius (1985) and the Paganini (1981) Competitions. Ilya Kaler was born in 
Moscow, Russia into a family of musicians. Major teachers at the Moscow Central Music School and the 
Moscow Conservatory included Zinaida Gilels, Leonid Kogan, Victor Tretyakov and Abram Shtern. Mr Kaler 
has earned rave reviews for solo appearances with distinguished orchestras throughout the world, which 
included the Leningrad, Moscow and Dresden Philharmonic Orchestras, the Montreal Symphony, the Danish 
and Berlin Radio Orchestras, Detroit Symphony, Baltimore Symphony, Seattle Symphony, New Japan 
Philharmonic, the Moscow and Zurich Chamber Orchestras, among others. His solo recitals have taken him 
throughout the former Soviet Union, the United States, East Asia, Europe, Latin America, South Africa and 
Israel. His recordings of the Paganini Caprices have been deemed by American Record Guide to be ‘in a class by 
themselves’ combining ‘the perfection, passion, and phrase sculpting of Michael Rabin with the energy, 
excitement, and immediacy of Jascha Heifetz.’ Other highly acclaimed recordings include Sonatas by 
Schumann and Brahms, Concertos by Paganini, Shostakovich, Tchaikovsky, Brahms, Schumann, Dvořák, 
Glazunov, as well as Taneyev Suite, Bach Sonatas and Partitas, to name a few. The Washington Post lauds him 
as, ‘a consummate musician, in total control at all times, with a peerless mastery of his violin.’ An active 
chamber musician, Mr Kaler has appeared at many major music festivals throughout the US and Europe with 
many of the most prominent musicians of our time. Mr Kaler’s orchestral career includes guest Concertmaster 
appearances with San Francisco Symphony, Philadelphia Orchestra and Baltimore Symphony, as well as 
regular tours with the World Orchestra for Peace under the direction of Valery Gergiev. He has also held a 
position of a concertmaster of the Rochester Philharmonic Orchestra, NY, for 5 years. One of the most 
sought-after teachers in the world, Ilya Kaler has served as a Professor of Violin at Indiana University School 
of Music in Bloomington, IN, Eastman School of Music in Rochester, NY, and is Professor of Violin at 
DePaul University School of Music in Chicago, IL. He lives with his wife Olga and two sons Daniel and Ariel 
in Wilmette, IL. Mr Kaler performs on a ‘Sennhauser’ Giuseppe Guarnerius del Gesu violin, 1735, on 
generous loan from the Stradivari Society of Chicago. 

Pianist ShengYuan Kuan has performed at the Kennedy Center, Weill Recital Hall, Taiwan National Concert 
Hall, and Musikverein in Vienna. She is a featured artist at the Heifetz International Music Institute, 
KUAF/Fulbright Summer Chamber Music Festival, Baltimore Symphony Orchestra's Chamber Music by 
Candlelight series, and the Sylvia Adalman Chamber Concert Series at Peabody Conservatory. Tim Smith of 
the Baltimore Sun praised Ms. Kuan as "(having) admirable technical finesse and expressive flair at the piano." 
Ms. Kuan has collaborated with famed musicians such as Nobuko Imai, Stefan Jackiw, Espen Lilleslatten, 
Richard Stolzman, KengYuen Tseng, Time for Three, and members of the Borromeo and Parker Quartets 
and Apollo Trio. She also made appearances at music festivals such as Bowdoin, Aria, Sarasota, Yellow Barn, 
Gijon Piano Festival and Norfolk Summer Music Festival. Ms. Kuan has received accolades from many 
competitions, including the 13th Beethoven Piano Competition in Vienna (Best Female Pianist Award, 2009), 
the 12th Taipei Chopin International Piano Competition (3rd Prize, 2008), Corpus Christi International 
Competition in Texas (2nd Prize, 2008), and New York Kosciuszko Chopin Piano Competition (3rd Prize, 
2003). She was also the recipient of Honolulu Morning Music Club Scholarship, Peabody Conservatory's 
Career Development Grant, Chamber Music Awards and Accompanying Assistantship. Currently serving as 
the collaborative pianist at Lynn University, Ms. Kuan holds degrees from the Yale School of Music and the 
Manhattan School of Music. She is a candidate of the Doctor of Musical Arts degree at the Peabody 
Conservatory under the guidance of Professor Boris Slutsky. For more information please visit 
Kuanpiano.weebly.com. 
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